Rupert Avery

From: Kevin Mist

Sent: 16 May 2006 15:46

To: Chris Hall

Subject: RE: COMMON PURPOSE INVOICE

Remove LMO5 from the invoice and forward to Warren , he will sort it out

Kevin Mist
Group Leisure Centres Manager
First Floor York Stream House

T —

St.lves Rd
Maidenhead
SL6 1QS
Tel: 01628 796443
----- Original Message-—— o
From: Chris Hall
/ Sent: 16 May 2006 12:17
! To: Kevin Mist
//‘ Subject: COMMON PURPOSE INVOICE
Kevin
Perhaps ane to raise with DVS-I've just had the invoice for £3k+ for the programme I'm on to be paid out of
LMO5.
Were you, like me, expecting this to be funded outside MLC budget? Can't justify blowing three sevenths of
A MLC budget on myself in current climate....
e e
Chris Halt

Magnet Leisure Centre Manager
Tel:01628 796103
Fax:01628 777010
E-mail: Chris.hall@rbwm.gov.uk



